CITY OF VINELAND, NJ

RESOLUTION NO. 2023- 635

A RESOLUTION DECLARING THE EXISTENCE OF AN
EMERGENCY REQUIRING DRAINAGE REMOVAL AND
REPLACEMENT ON 3RD STREET (BETWEEN 3RD
STREET ANNEX & LUCIANO AVENUE) AND
AUTHORIZING THE PAYMENT OF BILLS FOR SAID
SERVICES.

WHEREAS, the City Engineer’s Office has reported that an emergency condition has
developed on 3rd Street between 3 Street Annex and Luciano Avenue, just north of Tarkiln
Branch, related to a corrugated metal storm piping failure in the westerly paved shoulder, creating
a void that threatens to undermined the travel lane; and

WHEREAS, this situation poses an imminent danger to the public health and welfare if
left unattended with more storms to come through and wash away even more of the roadway.
Removal and replacement of the entire run of storm piping from Tarkiln Branch to the northerly
manhole on 3" Street will correct this issue; and

WHEREAS, due to this emergent situation, the City Engineer Office has solicited
quotations for completion of said removal and replacements; and

WHEREAS, authorization is requested to contract with Mathis Construction Co., Inc.,
Little Egg Harbor, NJ for Emergency Drainage Removal and Replacement on 3™ Street between
3" Street Annex and Luciano Avenue, in the amount not to exceed $87,304.50; and

WHEREAS, the Chief Financial Officer has certified the availability of funds for the
above emergency;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Vineland as
follows:

1. That the City Engineer is hereby authorized and directed to contract with Mathis
Construction Co., Inc., Little Egg Harbor, NJ, for Emergency Drainage Removal and
Replacement on 3 Street between 3™ Street Annex and Luciano Avenue, in the amount not to
exceed $87,304.50.

2. That the Purchasing Agent is hereby authorized and directed to issue purchase orders
to Mathis Construction Co., Inc., Little Egg Harbor, NJ, for Emergency Drainage Removal
and Replacement on 3 Street between 3" Street Annex and Luciano Avenue, in the amount not
to exceed $87,304.50.

3. That payment is hereby authorized pursuant to said purchase orders in accordance with
procedures for payment of bills and demands heretofore established by Ordinance number 1048.

Adopted:

President of Council

ATTEST:

City Clerk



Reid Wanda

Subject: FW: EMERGENCY REPAIR: 3rd ST. (BETWEEN 3rd St ANNEX & LUCIANO)

From: Caudill Rickie <rcaudill@vinelandcity.org>
Sent: Monday, December 11, 2023 8:48 AM
To: Dickenson Bob <bdickenson@vinelandcity.org>; Meneghetti Jeanine <jmeneghetti@vinelandcity.org>; Baldosaro

Susan M <sbaldosaro@vinelandcity.org>
Cc: Neher Jim <jneher@vinelandcity.org>; Portalatin Carmen <cportalatin@vinelandcity.org>; Maillet David

<dmaillet@vinelandcity.org>
Subject: EMERGENCY REPAIR: 3rd ST. (BETWEEN 3rd St ANNEX & LUCIANO)

Please take note that an emergency condition has developed on 3™ Street between 3™ Street Annex and
Luciano Avenue, just north of Tarkiln Branch.

Corrugated metal storm piping has failed in the westerly paved shoulder, creating a void that threatens to
undermine the travel lane. This poses an imminent danger to the public health and welfare if left
unattended with more storms to come through and wash away even more of the roadway. Removal and
replacement of the entire run of storm piping from Tarkiln Branch to the northerly manhole on 3™ Street
will correct this issue.

Mathis Construction is being directed to commence this work in the earliest possible timeframe. Carmen
will be entering a requisition this afternocon for the work. We will be funding this through our 2023 Capital
Improvement bond.

Best regards,

Rick Caudill, PE, CME

Supervising Engineer

Office Phone: (856) 794-4000 ext. 4608
Work Cell: (609) 774-5425

Email: rcaudill@vinelandcity.org

W& VINELAND
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Reid Wanda

Subject: FW: EMERGENCY REPAIR: 3rd ST. (BETWEEN 3rd St ANNEX & LUCIANO)
Attachments: Vineland - Third Street Repair.pdf

From: Caudil! Rickie <rcaudill@vinelandcity.org>

Sent: Monday, December 11, 2023 9:17 AM

To: Reid Wanda <wreid@vinelandcity.org>; Meneghetti Jeanine <jmeneghetti@vinelandcity.org>; Dickenson Bob
<bdickenson@vinelandcity.org>; Baldosaro Susan M <sbaldosaro@vinelandcity.org>

Cc: Neher Jim <jneher@vinelandcity.org>; Portalatin Carmen <cportalatin@vinelandcity.org>; Maillet David
<dmaillet@vinelandcity.org>; Lopez Regina <rlopez@vinelandcity.org>; PurchasingOffice
<PurchasingOffice@vinelandcity.org>

Subject: RE: EMERGENCY REPAIR: 3rd ST. (BETWEEN 3rd St ANNEX & LUCIANO)

Good morning Wanda,
You are correct. The contractor will be Mathis. Vendor |D# Mathi010.

The amount is $87,304.50 (see attached).
The account # is C-04-00-000-2322-78001.

From: Reid Wanda <wreid@vinelandcity.org>

Sent: Monday, December 11, 2023 9:11 AM

To: Meneghetti Jeanine <jmeneghetti@vinelandcity.org>; Caudill Rickie <rcaudill@vinelandcity.org>; Dickenson Bob
<bdickenson@vinelandcity.org>; Baldosaro Susan M <sbaldosaro@vinelandcity.org>

Cc: Neher Jim <jneher@vinelandcity.org>; Portalatin Carmen <cportalatin@vinelandcity.org>; Maillet David
<dmaillet@vinelandcity.org>; Lopez Regina <rlopez@vinelandcity.org>; PurchasingOffice

<PurchasingQffice@vinelandcity.org>
Subject: RE: EMERGENCY REPAIR: 3rd ST. (BETWEEN 3rd St ANNEX & LUCIANO)

Good morning,

Just confirm, the contractor will be Mathis Construction Co., Inc., Little Egg Harbor, NJ for repairing storm drain piping
on 3™ Street between 3™ Street Annex and Luciano Avenue?

Also, please have someone provide the amount and an account number.

Thank you

Wanda Reid
Administrative Secretary
Business Administration
856-794-4000 ext. 4140





