CITY OF VINELAND, NJ

RESOLUTION NO. 2015-

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF AN
AGREEMENT MODIFICATION NO. 2 WITH THE NEW
JERSEY DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION WITH
RESPECT TO THE RESURFACING OF LANDIS AVENUE,
PHASE | FROM MYRTLE STREET TO BOULEVARD.

WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Vineland on February 24, 2015, adopted
Resolution No. 2015-88 authorizing the execution of a cost reimbursement agreement with the
New Jersey Department of Transportation (NJDOT) with respect to the Resurfacing of Landis
Avenue, Phase | from Myrtle Street to Boulevard under Federal Project No. STP-1030 (108)
Construction; and

WHEREAS, on June 9, 2015, City Council adopted Resolution No. 2015-232,
authorizing the execution of Agreement Modification No. 1 for additional funding to provide for
construction engineering, in the amount of $57,469.00 increasing the reimbursement amount
from $1,933,471.00 to $1,990,940.00; and

WHEREAS, bids have been received for the above project and a second agreement
modification is now required because the recommended low bid is above the current authorized
NJDOT amount; and

WHEREAS, said modification will be in the amount of $120,736.00 increasing the
reimbursement amount from the City’s current authorized amount of $1,990,940.00 to
2,11,676.00; and

WHEREAS, the City must submit along with final reimbursement documents, a certified
copy of this resolution and four (4) original fully executed agreements for each modification; and

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Council of the City of Vineland that
the Mayor of the City of Vineland is hereby authorized to execute the Modification Agreement
No. 2 between the New Jersey Department of Transportation and the City of Vineland with
respect to the Resurfacing of Landis Avenue, Phase | from Myrtle Street to Boulevard under
Federal Project No. STP-1030 (108) Construction.

Adopted:

President of Council

ATTEST:

City Clerk

r-modify-fed-aid(2")



Reid Wanda

Subject: FW: Landis Avenue Phase I

From: Myers Brian

Sent: Tuesday, August 11, 2015 8:22 AM

To: Reid Wanda

Cc: Tonetta Richard; Dickenson Bob; Maillet David J.; Hicks Kathie
Subject: RE: Landis Avenue Phase I

Wanda -

The current authorized funding amount is $1,990,940.00, after Agreement Modification No. 1, which was for $57,469.00
to provide for construction engineering and testing costs. The construction contract for Charles Marandino LLC is for
$2,054,207.00, which would require a total authorization of $2,111,676.00. Therefore, the difference and the required
amount for Agreement Modification No. 2 would be $120,736.00.

Thanks,

Brian

Brian N. Myers PE CME
City Engineer

City of Vineland

640 E. Wood Street
Vineland, NJ 08362-1508

Direct Tel: (856) 7944000 ext 4091
Office Tel: (856) 7944090

Office Faxx (856} 4054606

Email: bmyers@®vinelandcity.org

VINELAND

New Jer‘sey
Oiscover The Difference smmmmwrr=ower::.

“We cannot solve problems with the same thinking
we used when we created them” — Albert Einstein

From: Myers Brian

Sent: Monday, August 10, 2015 11:36 AM
To: Tonetta Richard; Dickenson Bob

Cc: Reid Wanda

Subject: Landis Avenue Phase I

Rick/Bob-

The modification to the agreement with NJDOT is needed since the recommended low bid award is above the current
authorized amount from NJDOT. The award to the contractor is based on concurrence from NJDOT and the resolution
for the agreement modification will help facilitate the approval process between NJDOT and FHWA.

Thanks,
Brian



