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CITY OF VINELAND, NJ

RESOLUTION NO. 2014-220

A RESOLUTION AWARDING OPEN-END CONTRACTS FOR THE

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF GROUPED WAREHOUSE MATERIALS

#2014-A FOR THE VINELAND MUNICIPAL ELECTRIC UTILITY -

DISTRIBUTION DIVISION, ON AN INDIVIDUAL LINE ITEM BASIS TO

THE RESPECTIVE LOW BIDDERS AS PROVIDED |IN THE

SPECIFICATIONS.

WHEREAS, the City of Vineland has heretofore advertised for bids for the furnishing
and delivery of Grouped Warehouse Materials #2014-A for the Vineland Municipal Electric
Utility — Distribution Division, for a period of one year from date of award, with an option for a
second year, in accordance with specifications on file in the office of the Purchasing Agent; and

WHEREAS, on April 22, 2014, bids were received, duly opened and read aloud, being
referred to the Business Administrator for tabulation, evaluation, report and recommendation; and

WHEREAS, the Business Administrator has, under date of May 20, 2014, submitted a
written report and tabulation of the bids received and has recommended that open-end contracts
for the furnishing and delivery of Grouped Warehouse Materials #2014-A for the Vineland
Municipal Electric Utility — Distribution Division, be awarded on an individual line item basis to

the respective low bidders as provided in the specifications as follows:

Groups A (partial award), J (partial award), K, & Q — Estimated Total $14,371.86
Irby Company, Liverpool, NY

Groups A (partial award), B, C, D, E-1, E-2, F, G, H, |, J (partial award), L, N, O, P, R -
Estimated Total $109,148.06
HD Supply, New Castle, DE

Groups A (partial award), & M — Estimated Total $11,260.00
Rumsey Electric, Conshohocken, PA

said bids being the respective lowest bids received and considered in the best interest of the City
of Vineland; now, therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Vineland that said open-end contracts
for the furnishing and delivery of Grouped Warehouse Materials #2014-A for the Vineland
Municipal Electric Utility — Distribution Division, for a period of one year from date of award,
with an option for a second year, be and the same is awarded on an individual line item basis to
the respective low bidders as provided in the specifications, as stated above, said bids being the
respective lowest bids received and considered in the best interest of the City of Vineland, and the
Purchasing Agent be and the same is hereby authorized and directed to issue purchase order
contract for the same in behalf of the City; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Comptroller has certified that the funds for
the contracts to be awarded herein are available.

Adopted:

President of Council
ATTEST:

City Clerk

r-award3-warehouse
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May 20, 2014
REPORT TO: THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL

RE: Proposals Submitted to the Purchasing Board on 4/8/ & 4/22/14

Dear Mayor and Members of Council:
Submitted to you herewith for your consideration is our evaluation of the proposals submitted to the

Purchasing Board on April 8, and April 22, 2014.

COMPLETION OF SUPERVISORY CONTROL AND DATA ACQUISITION (SCADA) SYSTEM
REPLACEMENT FOR THE VINELAND MUNICIPAL UTILITIES

It is the recommendation of the Director of Electric Utility, which has the concurrence of the Business
Administrator, and the Purchasing Agent that a contract be awarded to the low bidder, CG Automation
Solution USA, Springfield, NJ, in the amount of $758,906.00 plus a 15% contingency in the amount of
$113,835.00 for a total award amount of $872,741.00, and reserving the right to award optional pricing,
as listed in Appendix 6 Section 4b (B1 — B11), in the amount of $165,769.00, to remain in effect for a
period of 180 days after Notice to Award.

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF LAMPS, HIGH INTENSITY DISCHARGE FOR THE
VINELAND MUNICIPAL ELECTRIC UTILITY DISTRIBUTION DIVISION, FOR A PERIOD OF
ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD, WITH OPTION FOR A SECOND YEAR

It is the recommendation of the Director of Electric Utility, which has the concurrence of the Business
Administrator, and the Purchasing Agent that open-end contracts be awarded on an individual Part basis
to the respective low bidders as provided in the specifications as follows:

PART A: High Pressure Sodium Vapor Lamps - Long Life, Instant Restrike) —
Total $5,723.74
PART D: Metal Halide Lamps — Pulse Start - Total § 252.90
PART F: Incandescent Traffic Lamp — 130 Volt - CLEAR Total $ 755.00
WESCO Distribution, Richmond, VA

PART B: Metal Halide Lamps — Standard (Probe Start) — Total $1.647.98
Rumsey Electric, Conshohocken, PA

PART C: Metal Halide Lamps — TCLP Compliant (Probe Start) - Total $ 164.40
Irby Company, Liverpool, NY

PART E: High Pressure Sodium Vapor Lamps — Standard - Total $ 169.20
Graybar Electric Co., Teterboro, NJ

Printed on Recycled Paper
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FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF GROUPED WAREHOUSE MATERIALS #2014-A FOR THE
VINELAND MUNICIPAL ELECTRIC UTILITY — DISTRIBUTION DIVISION, FOR A PERIOD OF
ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD. WITH AN OPTION FOR A SECOND YEAR

[t is the recommendation of the Director of Electric Utility, which has the concurrence of the Business
Administrator, and the Purchasing Agent that open end contracts be awarded on an individual line item
basis to the respective low bidders as provided in the specifications as follows:

Groups A (partial award). J (partial award). K. & Q — Estimated Total $14.371.86
Irby Company, Liverpool, NY

Groups A (partial award), B, C, D, E-1, E-2, F, G, H, I, J (partial award), L, N, O, P, R —
Estimated Total $109.148.06
HD Supply. New Castle, DE

Groups A (partial award). & M — Estimated Total $11.260.00
Rumsey Electric, Conshohocken, PA

CONSTRUCTION SERVICES FOR SCR INSTALLATION FOR THE VINELAND MUNICIPAL
ELECTRIC UTILITY

It is the recommendation of the Director of Electric Utility and the City’s consultants, which has the
concurrence of the Business Administrator, and the Purchasing Agent that a contract be awarded to the
low bidder, TN Ward Company, Ardmore, PA, in the amount of $2,860,000.00, plus a 15% contingency,
in the amount of $429,000.00 for a total award amount of $3,289,000.00.

We trust that the above recommendations will receive your favorable consideration and that the
recommended resolutions will be adopted as presented.

Respectfully sabmitted,

illiam Lutz
Business Administrator

/wr
Encls.

Printed on Recycled Paper
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BID EVALUATION FORM

DEPARTMENT Electric Utility - Distribution

Date: 05/09/2014

The undersigned recommends that a contract be awarded for the following:

1. Bid Title: Grouped Warehouse Materials #2014-A - Open Ended Contract

2. Amount to be Awarded: 513477992

[[]  Encumber Total Award ’b@

¢
Encumber by Supplemental Release D‘,@\\

3. Engineer’s Estimate: $143,000

4. Amount Budget: § N/A

5. Account Number to be Charged: 002-0-00-00-0000-2-1540000

6. Date Bids Received: 04/22/2014

7. Date to be Awarded: 0%/27/2014

8  Recommended Vendor: Split Award - See vendor recommendation.

9. Is Recommended Vendor the Apparent Lowest Bidder? Yes [ No

10. Comments/Special Instructions: 1hese are estimated awards.

11. Evaluation Performed by: Dexter L. Gordon / Senior Engineer
)« J/<( ’/\Q}\
12. Approved By: /I/)éé'}/é i ,
7

/

13. Attached: (Check-Off List)

[] Tabulation of Bids
Justification for Vendor Recommendation (if applicable)
Evaluation Data (if applicable)

Send copies to:
Purchasing Division
Business Administration
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Recommendation Detail Page 1 of 14
Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Unit Estimated
Award To: item # Manufacturer Catalog # Pricing Award
Group A Items - Lightning Arresters Split Award
Stuart C. Irby 127-001 Hubbell 21370977324 26.51 $1,590.60
HD Supply 127-004 HPS 2137037-7324 29.08 $872.40
Stuart C. Irby 127-005 Hubbell 2216097324 30.47 $731.28
Stuart C. Irby 127-006 Hubbell 215ELA10 56.00 $1,120.00
Rumsey Electric 127-007 Hubbell 215PLA10 127.00 $2,540.00
Rumsey - ltem #127-007
Delivery: 6 - 8 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Pricing firm thru 07/16/2014
Opton year pricing: Upto16%
See exception - Freight Allowed Minimum Order: Hubbell $2,750
Stuart C. Irby - item #127-001, 127-005 and 127-006.
Delivery: Irby Stock
Period above pricing is firm: Thru 12-31-2014
Opton year pricing: No
HD Supply - Item #127-004
Delivery: HD Stock - 4 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate
‘Group B Items - Brackets Group Award
HD Supply 208-030 Curlee W2006824T 69.51 $3,475.50
HD Supply 208-031 Curlee W20013846T 132.69 $398.07
HD Supply 208-032 Curlee W1253018 25.27 $2,527.00
HD Supply 208-034 Curiee V2004515T 44.23 $398.07

Delivery: HD Stock - 6 weeks

Period above pricing is firm: One Year

Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate

Tab: Recommendation #2014-A

Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon
Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014
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Recommendation Detail Page 2 of 14
Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Unit Estimated
- Award To: item # Manufacturer Catalog # Pricing Award
Group C items - Caps Group Award
HD Supply 247-010 HPS 215ICI 17.33 $519.90
Delivery: HD Stock - 4 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate
‘Group D Items - Clamps Group Award
HD Supply 280-043 MPS C1530 12.36 $618.00
HD Supply 280-050 HPS GA-102L 14.75 $737.50
HD Supply 280-051 HPS GA-108L 17.20 $860.00
HD Supply 280-053 HPS GH-103ACL 42.17 $2,108.50
Delivery: HD Stock - 8 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate
‘Group E-1 ltems - Wedge Connectors Group Award
HD Supply 319-046 Connector Products 119793 33.29 $832.25
HD Supply 319-043 Connector Products 795920 26.55 $663.75
HD Supply 319-040 Connector Products 477434 16.60 $415.00
HD Supply 319-039 Connector Products 477633 16.60 $415.00
HD Supply 319-038 Connector Products 477724 16.60 $415.00
HD Supply 319-049 Connector Products 477853 16.60 $415.00
HD Supply 319-050 Connector Products 954660 30.31 $757.75
HD Supply 319-051 Connector Products 954390 29.10 $727.50

Delivery: HD Stock - 4 weeks

Period above pricing is firm: One Year

Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate

Tab: Recommendation #2014-A

Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon
Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014
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Recommendation Detail Page 3 of 14
Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
) Unit Estimated
Award To: _ Item # Manufacturer Catalog # Pricing Award
Group E-2 Items - Bolted Connectors Group Award
HD Supply 319-201 MPS AVC-842G 12.25 $1,225.00
HD Supply 319-202 HPS GA9842GL 12.20 $1,220.00
HD Supply 319-203 HPS GA9843GL 12.35 $1,235.00
HD Supply 319-204 HPS GA-9520GL 21.88 $1,094.00
HD Supply 319-205 HPS GA-9954GL 24.22 $1,211.00
HD Supply 319-206 HPS GA-9101GL 68.18 $3,409.00
HD Supply 319-207 HPS GA-9100GL 62.31 $3,115.50
Delivery: HD Stock - 16 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate
‘Group F Items - Crossarms Group Award
HD Supply 340-002 Brooks CIVI-340-1 30.33  $15,165.00
HD Supply 340-006 AlumaForm FDA30-2-96-EB-FG 192.31 $961.55
HD Supply 340-007 Brooks CIVI-3444-10 37.83 $2,837.25
HD Supply 340-008 Brooks CIVI-4656-17 183.48 $366.96
Delivery: HD Stock - 4 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate
Group G Items - Cutouts, Switches & Accessories T?roup Award
HD Supply 347-003 HPS T710143T 62.96 $1,888.80
HD Supply 347-004 HPS T710133T 37.56 $751.20
HD Supply 347-005 S&C (procelain) 89031R10D 54.80  $14,796.00
HD Supply 347-200 Siemens 983X-35A8 2,617.03 $2,617.03

Delivery: HD Stock - 8 weeks

Period above pricing is firm: One Year

Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate

Tab: Recommendation #2014-A

Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon
Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014
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Recommendation Detail Page 4 of 14
Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Unit Estimated
Award To: item # Manufacturer Catalog # Pricing Award
Group H Items - Fuses Group Award
HD Supply 422-210 CPS FAH8KV12K-CG-R1 36.38 $363.80
HD Supply 422-211 CPS FAH8KV25K-CG-R1 38.61 $386.10
HD Supply 422-212 CPS FAH8KV40K-CG-R1 48.46 $484.60
HD Supply 422-213 Hi-Tech HTDE33-E-080 166.14 $830.70
Delivery: HD Stock - 10 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate
Group | Items - Ground Rod Materials Group Award
HD Supply 453-004 Galvan 6255510M 7.18 $3,590.00
HD Supply 453-010 Erico CC58 3.58 $2,685.00
Delivery: HD Stock - 3 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate
Group J Items - Indicators Split Award
Stuart C. Irby 498-003 Power Delivery Products PDP29-61140F8 188.00 $1,880.00
Stuart C. Irby 498-005 Power Delivery Products 41-2001-102 229.00 $6,183.00
HD Supply 498-006 SEL MB0200 45.66 $456.60
Stuart C. Irby - Iltems #498-003 & 498-005
Delivery: 1 - 3 weeks

Period above pricing is firm:
Opton year pricing:

HD Supply -
Delivery:

Period above pricing is firm:

Opton year pricing:

Tab: Recommendation #2014-A

Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon
Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014

Thru 12-31-2014

No

Item #498-006
HD Stock - 8 weeks

One Year

Will Re-evaluate
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Recommendation Detail Page 5 of 14
Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Unit Estimated
Award To: Item # __Manufacturer Catalog # Pricing Award
Group K Items - Insulators Group Award
Stuart C. Irby 507-021 Hubbell 5110041301 78.78 $472.68
Stuart C. Irby 507-033 MacLean GCC300120R2 .48.01 $960.20
Stuart C. Irby 507-035 MacLean GCC3054R2 27.98 $559.60
Delivery: 2 - 6 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Thru 12-31-2014
Opton year pricing: No
?-‘aroup L items - Lugs Group Award

HD Supply 567-039 Homac ALGOONTN 5.76 $288.00
HD Supply 567-040 Homac AL1/0-N 2.22 $111.00 -
HD Supply 567-041 Burndy YCA26-2N 7.39 $369.50
HD Supply 567-042 Homac HDL4/0N 7.95 $397.50
HD Supply 567-043 Homac SAMS00N 5.14 $257.00
HD Supply 567-044 HPS AL250NTN 2.87 $143.50
HD Supply 567-045 HPS AHL350VNTP 8.72 $436.00
HD Supply 567-046 Homac SAMS00N 5.14 $257.00
HD Supply 567-047 HPS AHL500BNTP 12.37 $618.50
HD Supply 567-049 HPS AHL700BN 10.73 $536.50

Delivery:
Period above pricing is firm:

Opton year pricing:

HD Stock - 9 weeks

One Year

Will Re-evaluate

Group M Items - ﬁberglass Poles

Group Award
Rumsey Electric 624-232 Shakespeare BS30-14-S2-BZ-2601  382.00 $1,910.00
Rumsey Electric 624-236 Shakespeare BS20-01-S1-BE-08 227.00 $6,810.00

Delivery: 4 - 6 weeks ARO Subject to change

Period above pricing is firm:

Opton year pricing:

Tab: Recommendation #2014-A

Pricing firm

thru 07/14/2014

Up to 20%

See exception - Freight Allowed Minimum Order: Shakespeare $3,300

Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon

Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014
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Recommendation Detail Page 6 of 14
Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Unit Estimated
- Award To: Item # Manufacturer Catalog # Pricing _ Award
Group N Items - Sleeves Group Award
HD Supply 777-401 Alcoa 5030.109 DIE 30AH 36.09 $216.54
HD Supply 777-402 Alcoa 5034.128 DIE 34AH 43.88 $131.64
Delivery: 8 - 10 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate
‘Group O Items - Splices Group Award
HD Supply 789-050 3M 8425-7 9.26 $277.80
HD Supply 789-051 M 8426-9 11.02 $330.60
HD Supply 789-052 3M 8427-12 16.46 $493.80
Delivery: HD Stock - 4 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate
Group P Items - Terminal Plugs (Bayonets) _ Group Award
HD Supply 869-001 Bumndy YE25R-25 1.62 $324.00
HD Supply 869-002 Homac X5N20 4.41 $882.00
HD Supply 869-003 Burmndy YE27R-60 4.59 $918.00
HD Supply 869-004 Homac X5N40 4.37 $874.00
HD Supply 869-005 Burndy YE30R-60 11.10 $2,220.00
HD Supply 869-006 Homac X5N336 6.71 $1,342.00
HD Supply 869-007 Burndy YE361R-60 12.63 $2,526.00
HD Supply 869-008 Burndy YE2R-25 1.68 $336.00

Delivery: HD Stock - 4 weeks

Period above pricing is firm:

One Year

Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate

Tab: Recommendation #2014-A

Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon
Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014
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Recommendation Detail Page 7 of 14

Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A

Unit Estimated

Award To: Item # Manufacturer Catalog # Pricing Award
Group Qltems - Terminators Group Award

Stuart C. Irby 872-100 Hubbell 215SB 29.15 $874.50

Delivery: Stock
Period above pricing is firm: Thru 12-31-2014
Opton year pricing: No
"Group R ltems - Fiberglass Transformer Pad, Ring, Cover and Secondary Enclosures
Group Award

HD Supply 389-003 Pencell PE30-HDX/ELECTRIC  80.98 $2,024.50

HD Supply 905-202 Nordic Fiberglass TP42425MG28X28 137.04 $4,111.20

HD Supply 905-203 Nordic Fiberglass V1839MGVMEU 233.29 $6,998.70

HD Supply 905-204 Nordic Fiberglass NDC36MG 129.35 $3,880.50

Delivery: HD Stock - 4 weeks

Period above pricing is firm: One Year

Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate

Total Estimated Award: $134,779.92
Bidder Awards Amount

HD Supply: $109,148.06

Rumsey Electric: $11,260.00

Irby: $14,371.86

Estimated Total Award $134,779.92

Tab: Recommendation #2014-A

Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon
Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014
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Page 8 of 14
Go Back to Agenda ‘
Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Received on 04/22/2014
Award on 05/23/2014
Rumsey Eloctric Stuart C. Irby HD Supply Power Soluti
GROUP AITEMS - Lightning Arresters
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-]
PURPOSES |QUANTI| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
|__ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG ¢ PRICE PRICE
127-001 10kv Heavy Duty Arrester 60 60 [] {ubbell 21370977324 34.17 2.050.20, Hubbell 21370977324 L300 MPS-J ZHP010-0C00100 31.70 1,902.00]
| _127-004 3kv Heavy Duty Amrester 30 0 30 Hubbell 2137097324 25.39 881 .ﬂ)[ Hubbel! 2137097324 HPS 2137037-7324 _ 72.40
127-005 10kv Riser Pole Arrester 24 48 24 Hubbell 2216097324 43.00 1,032.00) Hubbell 2216097324 MPS-J ZRP010-0C00100 34.39 825.35)
127-006 10kv Elbow Amester 20 40 20 Hubbell 1SELA10 62.00 1,240.00 Hubbell 215ELA10 CPS 3237018C10M 7.04 .140.80/
127-007 10kv Parking Stand Arester 20 20 20 fubbell 15PLATO @ 2.540.00 NO BID CPS 3237666C10M 13720 2.744.00]
SUB TOTAL| $7,743.90] © SUB TOTAL $7.484.56]
Delivery: {6 - 8 weeks Award ltem #127-007|Irby Stock Award Items #127-001,JHD Stock - 4 weeks Award Item #127-004]
l #127-005, & #127-008
Period above pricing is fim: Pricing firm thru 07/16/2014 Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
Split Award Split Award Split Award
Opton year pricing: [Up to 15% No jWill Re-evaluate
[See ion - Freight Aflowed Nini
GROUP BITEMS - Brackets
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INMAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-]
PURPOSES |QUANTI| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG 2 PRICE PRICE
208-030 € Ft Arm 50 0 50 Shakespeare MCS-0624-02 97.00 4,850.00] Shakespeare MCS-0624-02 92.00 4.600.00 Curlee W20088247 69.51 3,475.50]
208-031 12 Ft Amn 3 0 3 NO BID 0.00] NO BID .00 Curlee W20013846T 132.69 _398.07]
208-032 30 Inch Am 100 0 100 NO BID NO BID .00] Curlee W1253018 25.27 2,527.00
208-034 4 FtAm 0 Shakespeare 'AR-4-H £8.00, NO BID .00} Curlee V20045157 44.23 398.07
SUB TOTAL| SUB TOTAL|  $4.600.00] SUB TOTAL $6,798.64/
Delivery: 4 - 6 weeks HD Stock - 6 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Pricing firm thru 07/16/2014 Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing: Up to 20% None Offered Wil Re-evaluate
See ption - Freight Allowed Minimum
GROUP C [TEMS - Caps
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL
{EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-]
PURPOSES QUANTI ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
247-010 Insulated Cap 30 30 30 Hubbell 2151C) ] 23.00 690.00, Hubbell 2151C1 18.50 555.00 HPS 215iC1 17.33 518.90
: SUB TOTAL $690.09, SUB TOTAL $555.00] ¢ SUB TOTAL $518.90,
Delivery: 8 - 10 weeks Jirby Stock HD Stock - 4 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Pricing firm thru 07/16/2014 [Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing Up to 20% Will Re-evaluate
See ption - Freight Allowed Minimum

Tab: Evaluation £2014-A

Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon
Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014

N

. ltems indicated in RED are recommended awards.

ial Group #2014-A



Tab: Evaluation #2014-A
Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon  §

Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014

ltems indicated in RED are recommended awards.
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Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Received on 04/22/2014
Award on 05/23/2014
Rumsey Electric “Stuart C, irby HD Supply Power Soluti
FI’E—MS - Clamps
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-|
PURPOSES |QUANTI ORDER UNIT . UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION ONLY) Y QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
4/0 to #6 Cu Hot Line Clamp 50 (1] 50 Hubbell BH4 19.00 .00} Hubbell BH4 18.33 $916.50} MPS C1530 12.36 618.00
1/0 fo #8 Al Hot Line Clamp 50 [ 50 ubbel GA-102L 15.00 .00 Hubbell GA-102L 14.75 737.50} HPS GA-102L 14.75 737.50}
795 to 336 kCM AL Hot Line 50 50 50 Hubbell GA-108L 20.00 00, Hubbell GA-108L 19.09 954.50} HPS GA-108L 17.20 860.00;
2000 to 750 kCM Al Hot Line 50 0 50 Hubbell GH-103ACL 44.00 0.00| Hubbell GH-103ACL ] 42.56 2,128.00 HPS GH-103ACL 42.17| 2,108.50
SUB TOTAL 0.00, SUB TOTAL| $4,736.50 SUB TOTAL! $4,324.00|
Delivery: 4 - 8 weeks 6 - B weeks HD Stock - 8 weeks
Period above priting is firm: |Pricing firm thru 07/16/2014 Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing: [Up to 20% No JWili Re-evaluate
See exception - Freight Allowed Minimum
ITEMS - Wedge Connectors
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INMMAL
{EVALUATION | ORDER [Minimum RE-}
PURPOSES |QUANTI ORDER UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
1113 kCM /477 kCM AAC 25 [1] 25 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00§ Connector Products 118793 33.29 832.25|
795 kCM 1477 kCM AAC _25 0 20 NO BID .00] NO BID 0.00§ Connector Products 795920 26.55 663.75
477 KCM 1 477 kCM AAC 25 D 20 NO BID 00§ NO BID 0.00] Connector Products 477434 .60 415.00
477 kCM 1 336 kCM AAC 25 D 20 NO BID .00, NO BID 0.00§ Connector Products 477633 .60 415.00
477 kCM AAC / 4/0 Cu 25 1] 20 NO BID .00, NO BID 0.00] Connector Products 477724 .60 415.00
477 kCM AAC / 2/0 Cu 25 D 0 0 BID .00 NO BID 0.00] Connector Products 477853 .60 415,00
954 kCM / 477-636 kCM AAC 25 0 15 O BID .0.00, NO BID 0.00§ _Connector P 954660 30.31 757.75
954 kCM / 785-854 kCM AAC 25 0 15 NO BID .00, NO BID 0.00] C Products 954390 29.10 727.50
SUB TOTAL .00, SUB TOTAL. $0.00 SUB TOTAL| $4.641.25|
Delivery: HD Stock - 4 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
. Group Award
Opton year pricing Will Re-evaluate
2 TEMS -_Bolted Connect
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-
PURPOSES |QUANTI ORDER UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY | MANUFACTURER CATALOG 2 PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG 2 PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG & PRICE PRICE
795-477KCM ] 795-477KCM 100 0 10 Hubbell GA-8820GL 29.00 900.00, Hubbell GA-9820GL 28.30]  2,830.00 MPS AVC-842G 12.25] __ 1,225.00]
795-336kCM / 2/0-26 100 0 1 Hubbell GA9842GL 13.00 00 Hubbell’ GA9842GL .60 ,260.00) HP! GA9842GL .20, ,220.00
I 785-336kCM / 4/0-#1 100 0 100 Hubbell GABB43GL 13.00 .00 Hubbell GA9843GL 12.74 ,274.00] HP: GASB43GL 2.35 235.00]
-, 477-335kCM / 600-250kCM 50 50 50 Hubbell GA-8520GL 23.00) 00 Hubbell GA-8520GL 22.00 ,100.00 HP: GA-9520GL 21.88} ,094.00,
.. 954-795kCM / 336kCM-1/0 50 4] 50 Hubbell GA-8954GL 26.00) 00 Hubbell - GA-9954GL 24.98 ,248.00 HPS GA-8954GL 24.22| 1,211.00]
19- 1500-795kCM / 785-336kCM 50 [] 50 Hubbell GA-9101GL 73.00 .00 Hubbell GA-9101GL 0.30 ,515.00 HPS GA-9101GL 68.18} ,409.00}
319-" 1500-785kCM / 1500-795kxCM 50 1] 50 Hubbell GA-8100GL 65.00 .00 Hubbell GA-9100GL 64.24 ,212.00 HPS GA-9100GL 62.31] .115.50]
SUB TOTAL 0 SUB TOTAL| $14,439.00 SUB TOTAL| $12,509.50]
Delivery: 12 - 14 weeks 16 - 12 weeks HD Stock - 16 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Pricing firm thru 07/16/2014 Thrs 12-31-2014 One Year
» = Group Award
Opton year pricing JUp to 20% No Will Re-evaluate
See exception - Freight Allowed Minimum

Filename: Warehouse Materia! Group #2014-A
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Page 10 of 14
Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Received on 04/22/2014
Award on 05/23/2014
Rumsey Electric Stuart C. Irby HD Supply Power Solutions
GROUP F ITEMS - Crossarms
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-|
PURPOSES |QUANTI| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
| _ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
340-002 8 Wood Ci 500 500 300 . NO BID .00 Brooks CFO86PNYS 25.50] 12,750.00 __Brooks CIVI-340-1 30.33 15,165.00
340-006 8' Fiberglass C 5 0 2 NO BID 00| Shakespreare 10B09SN122Y2 289.00 ,445.00 AlumaForm FDA30-2-86-EB-FG 192. 861.55!
340-007 10' Wood Crossam 75 0 50 - __NOBID .00 Brooks CF108PNYS 38.00 2,850.00} - Brooks ClIVI-3444-10 37.83 2,837.25
340-008 17 Wood Crossamm _ 2 0 2 NO BID .00 NO BID 0.00] Brooks ClIVI-4656-17 183.48 366.96
‘. SUB TOTAL $0.00{ SUB TOTAL| $17,045.00] SUBTOTAL| $19,330.76}
Delivery: Irby Stock - 4 weeks HD Stock - 4 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing: INo Will Re-evaluate
|For item #340-002 & -007 - The s quoted are ptable. Neither :
arm has no provisions for using und d braces.
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INMMAL
(EVALUATION } ORDER |Minimum RE-]
PURPOSES |QUANTI] ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
| _ITEM _DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE - MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
347-003 Cutout 200A Door 30 30 24 Hubbell T710143T 64.0¢ 1,920.00 Hubbell . 17101437 50.02 1,500.60 HPS 17101437 52.96 1.858.80'
347-004 Cutout 300A Door 20 20 20 Hubbell T710133T 38.0¢( 760.00 Hubbell T710133T 20.74 594 .80} HPS T710133T 37.56 751.20
347-005 Distibution Cutouts 270 270 270 Hubbell CP710114PB 78.0¢ 21,060.00 Hubbet CP710114PB 83.00] 22.410.00) S&C lain) 89031R10D 54.80 14,796.00
Gang Operated Pole Top Switch
347-200 - 900 Amp 1 0 1 SIEMENS 983X-35A8 - | 2,700.00 2,700.00 SIEMENS 983X-35AS 2,680.00 2,680.00 Siemens 983X-35AS8 2,617.03 2,617.03
SUB TOTAL|  $26.440.00 ’ SUB TOTAL| $27.185.40 SUBTOTAL| $20.053.03
Delivery: 4 - 6 weeks Stock - 8 weeks

HD Stock - 8 weeks
Siemens - Pricing firm thru 04/30/2015

Stouts, Switches & Accessories Hubbell - Pricing fimn thru 07/16/2014 Thru 12-31-2014

[One Year
. Group Award
Opton year pricing to 20% No Will Re-evaluate
See exception - Freight Allowed Minimum
GROUP H ITEMS - Fuses
EVALUATION
QUANTTITY INMAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-
PURPOSES |QUANTI| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # ' PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE | PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
422-210 12 Amp CLF 10 0 NO BID .00} Hi-Tech __HTDE235012 40.58 405.80 CPS FAH8KV12K-CG-R1 36.38| 363.80
422- 25 Amp CLF 10 0 NO BID .00] Hi-Tech HTDE235025 46.68 466.80 CPS FAHBKV25K-CG-R1 38.61| 386.10
422-212 40 CLF 10 0 1 NO BID .00] Hi-Tech HTDE235040 54.64 546.40) CPS FAH8KV40K-CG-R 48.45} 484.60
422-; 80 Amp CLF 5 0 5 NO BID .00] Hi-Tech HTDE33E080 165.90 29.50 Hi-Tech HTDE33-E-080 166.14} 830.70

SUB TOTAL S0.00I SUB TOTAL| $2.248.50] - SUBTOTAL| _ $2.065.20
Delivery: S - 8 weeks HD Stock - 10 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Thru 05-01-2015 One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing: None Offered Will Re-evaluate
Tab: Evaluation #2014-A
Evaluated by: Dexter L Gordon
Senior Engineeer

May 13, 2014 Items indicated in RED are recommended awards. Filename: Warehouse Material Group 22014-A
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Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A

Page 11 of 14

. Received on 04/22/2014
Award on 05/23/2014
Rumsey Electric Stuart C. Irby HD Supply Power Solutions
GROUP | ITEMS - Ground Rod Materials
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-]
PURPOSES |QUANTI] ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
453-004 §' Pointed Ground Rod 500 0 250 Hubbell C615850 10.00 5,.000.00 Erico 615850 7.80 .950.00 Galvan 6255510M 7.18 3,580.00
453-010 Threadless Couplings 750 0 250 Hubbell CCCcs8 7.25 5.437.50 Erico CC58 3.70 2,.775.00] Erico CC58 3.58 2,685.00|
SUB TOTAL| $10.437.50, SUB TOTAL|  $6.725.00 SUBTOTAL] $6,275.00}
Delivery: EB - 10 weeks 1 - 3 weeks HD Stock - 3 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Pricing firm thru 07/14/2014 Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing Lip to 20% No Will Re-evaluate
|See ption - Freight Allowed Minimum
GROUP JITEMS - Indicators .
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL .
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-
PURPOSES |QUANTI ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) Y QUANTTTY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER - CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG & PRICE PRICE
498-003 400 amp URD Indicator 0 0 Power Delivery Prodﬁl NO BID 0.00] Power Delivery Product: PDP29-61140F8 188.00 1,880.00} Power Delivery Products 29-6114-0F8 189.34 1,893.40
498-005 800 amp OH Indicator 27 27 27 Power Delivery Products| NO BID 0.00] Power Delivery Produ 41-2001-102 229.00 6,183.00} Power Delivery Products 41-2001-102 261.11 7,049.97|
498-006 200 amp URD Indicator 0 0 10 i NO BID 0.00 | NO BID 0.00 SEL MB0200 45.66 456.60
SUB TOTAL $0.00] SUB TOTAL $8,063.00] SUB TOTAL $8,399.97|
Delivery: 1 - 3 weeks Item #498-003 & HD Stock - 8 weeks Item #498-006.
#498-005.
Period above pricing is firm: Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
Split Award Split Award
Opton year pricing: No JWili Re-evaluate
GROUP K ITEMS - Insulators
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INIMAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-
PURPOSES |QUANTI| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
|_507-021 69kV Dead-end type [ 0 [ Hubbel 5110041301 89.00 534.00 Hubbell 5110041301 78.78 472.68 HPS 511004-1301 78.76 472.56]
507-033 120" Guy Strain type 20 0 20 Hubbell GS30120CC1 44.00 880.00 MaclLean GCC300120R2 48.01 960.20 AlumaForm FGS30-120CR 43.84/ 876.80
507-035 54" Guy Strain type 20 0 20 Hubbell GS30054CC2 35.50i 710.00 MacLean GCC3054R2 27.98 559.60) AlumaForm FGS30-54RR 34.89 697.80
SUB TOTAL| $2,124.00| SUB TOTAL SUBTOTAL|{  $2,047.16|
Delivery: 18 - 20 weeks 2 - 6 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Pricing firm thru 07/16/2014 Thru 12-31-2014
Group Award -
Opton year pricing: Up to 20% No Will Re-evaluate
See exception - Freight Allowed Minimum |

Tab: Evaluation #2014-A

Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon
Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014

Items indicated in RED are recommended awards.

Filename: Warehouse Material Group #2014-A
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Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Received on 04/22/2014
Award on 05/23/2014
Rumsey Electric Stuart C. Irby HD Supply Power Solutions
GROUP L ITEMS - Lugs
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-
PURPOSES |QUANTI| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
{TEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG ¢ PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
|_567-039 600 kCM / Al-Cu 50 50 NO BID 0.00] Bumdy YA3EA3 13.80 680.00 Homac ALGOONTN .76 288.00|
567-040 110 str/Al 50 50 NO BID 0.00] Bumdy YCA25R .42 121.00 Homac AL1/0-N .22 111.00
567-041 2/0 str/ Cu 50 50 NO BID .00| 3umdy YCA262N .06 253.00 Bumdy YCA28-2N .39 369.50
|_567-042 4/0 str/ Cu 50 50 NO BID .0 umndy YCA2B2N .30 365.00 Homac HDL4/ON 7.95 357.50/
567-043 4/0 str/ A 50 50 NO BID - 0.0 3umdy YCA3SR2N 5.83 281.50 mac SAMS0ON .14/ 257.00
567-044 250 kCM 7 Al-Cu 50 50 NOBID 0.0 umndy YCAK29A-2G1 13.94 697.00 HPS AL250NTN 87 _143.50]
567-045 350 kCM / Al-Cu 50 50 NO BID 00 urndy YCAK31A-2G1 15.25 762.50 HPS AHL3S50VNTP .72 436.00,
| 567-046 477 KCM/ Al 50 50 NO BID .00 urndy YCA35R2N .83 291.50] Homac SAMSOON .14 257.00
|_567-047 500 kCM / Al-Cu 50 50 NO BID .00 urndy YCAK34R2G3 15.80] 798 .OOI HPS AHLS00BNTP 12.37 618.50,
567-049 750 kCM / Al 50 50 NO BID .00 Burmndy AHC700BN 10.80| 540.00, HPS AHL700BN 10.73 536.50
SUB TOTAL $0.00) SUBTOTAL| _ 54,806.50 SUBTOTAL| _ $3.414.50]
Delivery: 1 - 4 weeks HD Stock - 8 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing: No Will Re-evaluate -
GROUP M ITEMS - Fiberglass Poles
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INIMAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-]
PURPOSES |QUANTI| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG ¢ PRICE PRICE
624-232 30" Street Light Pole 5 0 5 Shakespeare BS30-14-S2-BZ-2601 382.00 1,910.0¢ Shakespeare BS30-14-S2-BZ-2601 425.00 2,125.00, Shakespeare BS30-14-S2-B2-2601 407.29 2,036.45|
624-236 20’ Street Light Pole 30 30 30 Shakesp BS20-01-S1-BE-08 227.00 6,810.0 Shakespeare B8S20-01-S1-BE-08 244.00 7,320.00, Shakespeare BS20-01-S1-BE-08 223.66 6,709.80'
SUB TOTAL $8.720.0i SUB TOTAL| $9,445.00 SUB TOTAL| - $8,746.25|
Delivery: 4 - 6 weeks ARO Subject to change 4 - 6 weeks 4 - 6 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Pricing firm thru 07/14/2014 Thru 05-01-2015 One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing: Up to 20% No Will Re-evaluate
[See ption - Freight Allowed Minimum
GROUP N ITEMS - Sleeves
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-
PURPOSES |[QUANTI| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) 1Ad QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG 2 PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
777-401 795kCM Sleeve /AAC/Arbutus [] 0 6 NO BID 0.00 NO BID 0.00 Alcoa 5030.109 DIE 30AH 36.09 216.54
777402 1113kCM Sleeve JAAC/Marigold 3 0 3 NO BID 0. Jp_l NO BID 0.00 Alcoa 5034.128 DIE 34AH 43.88 131.64
SUB TOTAL $0.00 SUB TOTAL| $0.00 . SUB TOTAL| 348.18
Detlivery : . 18 - 10 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
. Group Award
Opton year pricing: jwill Re-evaluate
Tab: Evaluation #2014-A
Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon
Senior Engineeer

May 13, 2014 Items indicated in RED are recommended awards.

Filename: Warehouse Materia! Group #2014-A
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Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon

Senior Engineser
May 13, 2014

Items indicated in RED are recommended awards.

. . Page 13 of 14
Go Back to Agenda Evaluation Detail
Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Received on 04/22/2014
Award on 05/23/2014
— Rumsey Electric Stuart C. Irby HD Supply Power Solutions
GROUP O ITEMS - Splices -
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL
{EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-|
PURPOSES |QUANTI| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG & PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
7809-050 #101/0 Al 30 0 0 NO BID 0.00 NO BID ___0.00 3M 8425-7 9.26 277.80
789-05 2/0 to 250 Al 30 30 NO BID 0.00] M 8426-9 11.72 351.60, 3M 8426-9 11.02 330.60
789-052 250 to 400 Al 0 0 NO BID 0.00 3M 8427-12 17.30 519.00 M 8427-12 16.46 493.80|
SUB TOTAL $0.00, SUB TOTAL $870.60} SUBTOTAL| $1,102.20
Delivery: 2 weeks HD Stock - 4 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing: No Will Re-evaluate
GROUP P ITEMS - Terminal Plugs
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INIMAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-]
PURPOSES |QUANT!| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) Y QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG ¢ PRICE PRICE
869-001 fOstr/ Al 200 200 200 NO BID 0.00| 3umdy YE25R25 1.80| 360.00} Bumdy YE25R-25 1.62 324.00|
868-002 2/0str/ Al 200 0 200 NO BID 0.00 umd: YE26R60 4.52 904.00} Homac XSN20 4.41 882.00
869-003 3/0 str / Al 200 0 200 NO BID .00| Sumdy YE27R60 4 .ﬁi 74.00] Bumdy YE27R-60 4.59 18.00/
869-004 410 str 1 Al 200 200 NO BID .00 3umdy YE268R60 5.36| ,072.00 Homac XSN40 4.37 74.00}
869-005 300 kCM /Al 200 200 NO BID .00 smdy YE30R60 .76 ,352.00 Bumdy YE30R-60 11.10 2,220.00}
869-006 350/400 kCM / Al 200 100 200 NO BID .00] Sumdy YE32R60 .08| ,216.00 Homac X5N336 6.71 1,342.00|
869-007 4771500 KCM / Al 200 100 200 NOBID _ 0.00] Sumdy YE361R60 3.39 .678.00] Bumdy YE361R-60 12.63 2.526.00]
869-008 #2striA 200 100 200 NO BID 0.00] umd YE2R25 .80 360.00) Bumdy YE2R-25 1.68 336.00
SUB TOTAL $0.00 SUBTOTAL| $10,916.00 SUBTOTAL| §9.422.00
Delivery: 1 .- 3 weeks HD Stock - 4 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
. . Group Award
Opton year pricing No Will Re-evaluate
GROUP Q ITEMS - Terminators
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INMAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |[Minimum RE-
PURPOSES |QUANTI| ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG ¢ PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
872-100 Insulating Standoff 30 30 30 NO BID 0.00 Hubbeli 2155B 29.15 874.50 Elastimold 161SOP 32.64 979.20|
SUB TOTAL $0.00, SUB TOTAL $874.50, SUB TOTAL $979.20)
Delivery: |Stock HD Stock - 4 weeks
Poriod above pricing is firm: Thru 12-31-2014 One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing No Will Re-evaluate |

Warah
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Page 14 of 14

Open Ended Specification for
Grouped Warehouse Material #2014-A
Received on 04/22/2014
Award on 05/23/2014
RumseyJE-i;cuic ~Stuart C. Irby HD Supply Power Solutions
GROUP RITEMS - Fiberglass Transformer Pad, Ring, Cover and Secondary Enclosures
EVALUATION
QUANTITY INITIAL
(EVALUATION | ORDER |Minimum RE-]
PURPOSES |QUANTI{ ORDER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
| [TEM DESCRIPTION ONLY) TY QUANTITY MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE MANUFACTURER CATALOG # PRICE PRICE
88-00 S dary Enclosure wilid 25 25 25 NO BID 0.00| NO BID 0.00 Pencell PE30-HDX/ELECTRIC 80.88 2,024.50|
05-20; Single Phage XFMR Pad 30 40 20 Nordic Fiberglass NO BID 0.00 Nordic Fiberglass NO BID 0.00] _ Nordic Fiberglass TP42425MG28X28 137.04 4.111.20
305-20. Leveling Ring 0 40 20 Nordic Fibemlass NO BID 0.00, Nordic Fiberglass NO BID .00] _ Nordic Fiberglass V183SMGVMEU 233.29 6,998.70|
05-204 Cover 0 0 5 Nordic Fiberglass NO BID L 0.00| Nordic Fiberglass NO BID ogl Nordic Fib NDC36MG | 129.35 3,880.50]
SUB TOTAL $0.00 SUB TOTAL $0.00 SUBTOTAL| $17,014.90
Delivery: HD Stock - 4 weeks
Period above pricing is firm: One Year
Group Award
Opton year pricing: Will Re-evaluate
TOTAL RUMSEY ELECTRIC $81,376.40, TOTAL IRBY ELECTRIC $118,832.38| TOTAL HD SUPPLY $136,476.20|
|Exceptions: Exceptions: Exceptions:
Freight Allowed Minimums are as follows: None Noted None Noted
Hubbel] $2,750
Shakespeare $3,300 Estimated Total Award to Rumsey:  $11,260.00)Special Note: Estimated Tota! Award to Irby:  $14,371.86 Estimated Tota! Award to HD:  $108,148.06
Siemens $3,000 For Group F - ltems #340-002 & #340-007 - Quotes disqualified. Neither

Tab: Evaluation #2014-A

Evaluated by: Dexter L. Gordon
Senior Engineeer
May 13, 2014

items indicated in RED are recommended awards.
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